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The 22nd International Conference on Few-Body Problems in Physics was
held in Fukuoka, Japan from 24 to 30 September 2017. The conference
was attended by over 200 scientists from 25 countries and covered a wide
range of topics in few-body physics, including few-body reactions, few-body
systems with exotic particles, and few-body systems in astrophysics. The
proceedings of the conference have been published in a special issue of
the journal Few-Body Systems.
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Few-body reactions are reactions involving a small number of particles,
typically three or four. These reactions are important for understanding the
structure and properties of nuclei, as well as for astrophysical applications.
At the conference, there were several presentations on the latest
developments in the study of few-body reactions.

One of the most important topics in few-body reactions is the three-body
force. The three-body force is a force that acts between three particles and
is not simply the sum of the two-body forces between the particles. The
three-body force is important for understanding the structure and properties
of nuclei, as well as for astrophysical applications.

At the conference, there were several presentations on the latest
developments in the study of the three-body force. One of the most
important developments is the development of new methods for calculating
the three-body force. These new methods are making it possible to
calculate the three-body force more accurately and efficiently, which is
leading to a better understanding of the structure and properties of nuclei.

Few-Body Systems with Exotic Particles

Few-body systems with exotic particles are systems that contain particles
that are not found in ordinary matter. These particles can include hyperons,
mesons, and antiparticles. Few-body systems with exotic particles are
important for understanding the structure and properties of hadrons, as well
as for astrophysical applications.

At the conference, there were several presentations on the latest
developments in the study of few-body systems with exotic particles. One
of the most important topics in this area is the study of hyperon-nucleon



interactions. Hyperon-nucleon interactions are important for understanding
the structure and properties of hypernuclei, which are nuclei that contain
hyperons.

At the conference, there were several presentations on the latest
developments in the study of hyperon-nucleon interactions. One of the
most important developments is the development of new experimental
techniques for studying hyperon-nucleon interactions. These new
techniques are making it possible to study hyperon-nucleon interactions
more accurately and efficiently, which is leading to a better understanding
of the structure and properties of hypernuclei.

Few-Body Systems in Astrophysics

Few-body systems in astrophysics are systems that contain a small
number of particles that play an important role in astrophysical processes.
These systems can include planetary systems, binary stars, and white
dwarf stars. Few-body systems in astrophysics are important for
understanding the formation and evolution of stars and planets, as well as
for understanding the behavior of matter in extreme environments.

At the conference, there were several presentations on the latest
developments in the study of few-body systems in astrophysics. One of the
most important topics in this area is the study of planetary systems.
Planetary systems are important for understanding the formation and
evolution of stars and planets, as well as for understanding the possibility of
life beyond Earth.

At the conference, there were several presentations on the latest
developments in the study of planetary systems. One of the most important



developments is the discovery of new planetary systems, including systems
with multiple planets and systems with planets that are orbiting stars other
than the Sun. These new discoveries are providing new insights into the
formation and evolution of planetary systems.

The 22nd International Conference on Few-Body Problems in Physics was
a successful event that brought together scientists from all over the world to
discuss the latest developments in few-body physics. The conference
covered a wide range of topics, including few-body reactions, few-body
systems with exotic particles, and few-body systems in astrophysics. The
proceedings of the conference have been published in a special issue of
the journal Few-Body Systems.
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