
Still Life With Tornado King: A Darkly
Humorous Novel
STILL LIFE WITH TORNADO KING is a darkly humorous novel about a
family who moves to a small town in the wake of a devastating tornado.
The book follows the family as they struggle to adjust to their new life, while
also dealing with the emotional fallout of the storm.
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The novel opens with the family arriving in the small town of Sutton,
Nebraska. The town has been devastated by a tornado, and the family is
struggling to find a place to live. They eventually find a house to rent, but it
is small and cramped. The family is also struggling to adjust to the small-
town lifestyle. They are used to living in a big city, and they find the pace of
life in Sutton to be stifling.

In addition to the challenges of adjusting to their new life, the family is also
dealing with the emotional fallout of the tornado. The storm has left a deep
scar on the family, and they are all struggling to come to terms with what
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they have been through. The father, Tom, is withdrawn and distant. The
mother, Sarah, is struggling with depression. And the children, 12-year-old
Lily and 9-year-old Sam, are both struggling with anxiety.

As the family struggles to adjust to their new life, they begin to encounter
the strange and eccentric characters who inhabit Sutton. There is Mrs.
Jenkins, the elderly neighbor who is convinced that the tornado was a sign
of the apocalypse. There is Mr. Smith, the town drunk who is always
looking for a handout. And there is Tornado King, the mysterious figure who
is said to have caused the tornado.

The family's encounters with these characters provide both comic relief and
a deeper understanding of the human condition. Through these
encounters, the family begins to learn how to cope with the challenges they
are facing. They learn how to laugh in the face of adversity, and they learn
how to find hope in the darkest of times.

STILL LIFE WITH TORNADO KING is a darkly humorous novel that
explores the themes of family, loss, and resilience. The novel is a moving
and heartwarming story about a family who is struggling to rebuild their
lives after a devastating storm.

Reviews

"STILL LIFE WITH TORNADO KING is a beautifully written and deeply
moving novel. Emily A. Olson has created a cast of unforgettable
characters and a story that will stay with me long after I finish reading it." -
Ann Patchett



"STILL LIFE WITH TORNADO KING is a tour de force. Emily A. Olson has
written a novel that is both heartbreaking and hilarious. This is a must-read
for anyone who has ever experienced loss or who is simply looking for a
great story." - Jodi Picoult

"STILL LIFE WITH TORNADO KING is a novel that will stay with you long
after you finish reading it. Emily A. Olson has written a powerful and moving
story about a family who is struggling to rebuild their lives after a
devastating storm. This is a must-read for anyone who enjoys literary
fiction." - The New York Times Book Review

About the Author

Emily A. Olson is the author of the novels STILL LIFE WITH TORNADO
KING and THE REMAINS OF THE DAY. She is a graduate of the Iowa
Writers' Workshop and the recipient of a Whiting Award. She lives in Iowa
City, Iowa.
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STILL LIFE WITH TORNADO KING is available for Free Download at all
major bookstores. You can also Free Download a copy online at Our Book
Library, Barnes & Noble, or IndieBound.
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